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DATE: 11.5.20-15.5.20       YEAR GROUPS Nursery and Reception  
RELIGIOUS EDUCATION FOCUS WEEK    BIBLE STORY: https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=gGAcaFfWmiQ 
 

MONDAY  TUESDAY  WEDNESDAY  THURSDAY  FRIDAY  
Watch the story of Noah’s Ark by 
clicking on the link above.  
Throughout the story Noah felt 
lots of different emotions. Can 
you find a time in the story when 
Noah was worried? Happy? Why 
did Noah feel this way?  
  
What does your face look like 
when you feel different emotions? 
Use a mirror to see how your 
expression changes when you feel 
happy, angry, sad, excited, 
scared.   

  
Reflection: How are you feeling at 
the moment? Why do you feel this 
way? Can you think of people or 
things that make you happy when 
you feel sad?   
  
Links to other areas of Learning:   
PSED/Lit/PD: Imagine you are like 
Noah and have to go on the ark. 
There is only space for people 
who are special to you, people 
who make you happy. Can you 

Watch the story of Noah’s Ark 
again.   
Why did God choose Noah to 
build the ark? Noah was chosen to 
build the Ark because God 
recognised that he was a good 
person. Miss Minogue and Miss 
Ding are always impressed with 
how good you are at school. Can 
you think of some things that you 
do at home to show that you are 
making good choices?   
  
We would have chosen you to 
help build the Ark because we 
think you are special. Think about 
why God might have chosen you 
to go on the Ark? Do you have a 
special talent? What makes you 
special/different?  
  
Links to other areas of Learning:   
UOW: All of the animals were 
chosen to go on the Ark as they 
were all special in different ways.   
Watch the different animals at the 
zoo. What differences can you 

Noah and his family had to be very 
patient on the ark waiting for the 
flood to stop. What does it mean 
to be patient? We have to be 
patient when we are waiting for 
something. Can you think of a 
time when you had to be patient? 
Here are some examples waiting 
for your dinner to cook, waiting 
for your turn on the swing, waiting 
for your birthday. At the moment 
we all have to be very patient and 
wait to see our friends and family 
and to go back to school. Is it hard 
sometime to be patient? How can 
we make it easier?  
  
Links to other areas of Learning:   
PSED: Noah has been on the boat 
for a long time and can’t get off 
because of the flood. Can you 
think of some things he and his 
family could do together to stop 
them getting bored? Can you play 
a game with your family? 
Remember to take it in turns.  
  

In the Story of Noah’s Ark the 
rainbow was a sign of hope that 
appeared when the rain stopped. 
At the moment there are lots of 
rainbows in people’s windows as a 
sign of hope and to say thank you 
to people who are helping us. On 
your daily walk can you spot any 
rainbows? Can you count how 
many rainbows you find?  
  
Reflection- Who helps you and 
looks after you? Who would you 
want to say thank you to?  
  
Links to other areas of Learning:   
EAD: Can you create your own 
rainbow as a sign of hope by 
mixing colours together to make 
the different colours of the 
rainbow. Use paint to see if you 
make the colour orange? Green? 
Purple?  
  
If you don’t have any paint:  
There are 7 colours in the 
rainbow. Red, orange, yellow, 

God wanted Noah and all of the 
animals to be safe on the Ark. At 
the moment we all have to stay at 
home so that we can stay safe. 
We all have special places that we 
go to that make us feel happy and 
or where we feel safe. Where do 
you feel safe? Do you have 
somewhere that is a special place 
for you to go to? Why is it special 
to you?  
  
For Christians Church is a special 
place. Can you think of times 
when you have been to Church? 
Mother’s Day assembly? 
Christmas carol service? Sunday 
service? Why do you think Church 
is a special place?     
  
Links to other areas of Learning:   
UOW/PSED: The world is a very 
special place. During your daily 
walk can you use your good 
looking eyes to explore the area 
you live? What is special about the 
natural world around us? The 

https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=gGAcaFfWmiQ
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draw a picture of people who are 
special to you? Can you label the 
people in your picture? Why are 
these people special to you? What 
do they do to make you happy?  
  
Maths: Noah had to think about 
who was allowed on the Ark. He 
wanted pairs of animals for his 
ark. A pair means two of 
something. Lots of things come in 
pairs. What pairs can you find 
around your house?   
How many pairs of these can you 
find:   

 Socks  

 Shoes  

 Gloves  
If you have playing cards at home 
why not play a game of snap or 
pairs memory game to find the 
matching pairs. You could always 
make your own pairs game by 
drawing some of the animals from 
the Ark on different pieces of 
paper.  

spot between the animals? For 
example, the meerkats are small 
and fluffy but the elephants are 
big and wrinkly.   
https://www.chesterzoo.org/vi
rtual-zoo-2/         
  
Physical Development:  
In the story you will see that all of 
the animals move in different 
ways. Can you move like the 
different animals on the ark?   

Jump like a frog  
Waddle like a penguin  
Stomp like an elephant  
March like an ant  
Slither like a snake  

What other animals can you 
pretend to be?   
Can you turn this into a race? Who 
is the fastest in your house?  
  
  
  
  

Literacy/Physical Development: 
Another game Noah could have 
played on the Ark was eye spy. 
Look at the picture of Noah’s ark. 
Can you find an animal on the ark 
beginning with these different 
letter sounds:   
Cc    Tt    Pp    Mm   Oo   Dd   Ff  Bb  
Can you make a list of the animals 
you have found? Nursery you 
could try drawing the animals and 
if you feel confident try copying 
the initial sound.  
  

green, blue, indigo, violet. Can you 
find a different object in your 
house for each colour of the 
rainbow?    
  
EAD: Can you make a rain maker 
instrument using an old cardboard 
tube, rice and tin foil? Take a look 
at the instructions and see if you 
can make it. 
http://www.pinkstripeysocks.com
/2015/09/how-to-make-
cardboard-rainmakers-preschool-
craft.html  
If you don’t have any rice can you 
take it in turns to fill an empty 
bottle with different things. Which 
one sounds the most like rain?  
  
  
  

natural world looks after us in 
many ways: trees give us air to 
breath, flowers create a beautiful 
scent for us to smell, bees create 
honey for us to eat. How can we 
help look after the natural world? 
E.g don’t drop litter.  
  
UOW/PSED/EAD: All of the 
animals would of needed to be 
kept safe on the Ark. Do you have 
a pet at home? How do you keep 
them safe and happy? How would 
you look after the animals? Can 
you pretend to be a vet and look 
after your cuddly toys?  
  
EAD: The Ark kept Noah and the 
animals safe. Can you pretend to 
be Noah and build a model of the 
Ark? You could use lego, blocks, 
junk modelling. You could always 
make a model of your safe place.  
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